

Schedule 1
[image: Commonwealth Coat of Arms]

Telecommunications (Numbering Charges) (Allocation Charge) Amendment Determination 2022 (No. 1) 

The Australian Communications and Media Authority makes the following determination under subsection 13(1) of the Telecommunications (Numbering Charges) Act 1997.
[bookmark: BKCheck15B_1]Dated: 


[bookmark: Minister]Member



Member/General Manager

Australian Communications and Media Authority - DRAFT FOR CONSULTATION



CONSULTATION DRAFT




Draft – for consultation only


Telecommunications (Numbering Changes) (Allocation Charge) Amendment 
Determination 2022 (No. 1)

Draft – for consultation only
1
[bookmark: _Toc444596031]
1  Name
[bookmark: BKCheck15B_3]		This is the Telecommunications (Numbering Charges) (Allocation Charge) Amendment Determination 2022 (No. 1).
[bookmark: _Toc444596032]2  Commencement
		This instrument commences at the start of the day after it is registered. 
Note:	The Federal Register of Legislation may be accessed free of charge at www.legislation.gov.au.
[bookmark: _Toc444596033]3  Authority
		This instrument is made under subsection 13(1) of the Telecommunications (Numbering Charges) Act 1997.
[bookmark: _Toc444596034]4  Amendments
		The instrument that is specified in Schedule 1 is amended as set out in the applicable items in that Schedule. 
 


Section 1


Schedule 1—Amendments
[bookmark: _Toc444596036]Telecommunications (Numbering Charges) (Allocation Charge) Determination 2015 (F2015L01152)
1  Subsection 5(1), Table 1
Omit “$35” wherever occurring, substitute “$57”.
2  Subsection 5(2), Table 2 
Omit “$35” wherever occurring, substitute “$57”.
3  Subsection 5(2), Example text after Table 2
Omit “$35 ÷ 2 000 = $0.0175”, substitute “$57 ÷ 2 000 = $0.0285”



image1.jpg




